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From: Editor ARPG <editor@arpgweb.com> 

Date: Mon, July 02, 2018 at 5:28 PM 

Subject: Re: My team's article: Thank: Scopus Journal - The Journal of Social Sciences Research 

To: Syaiful <pak_bakri@unja.ac.id> 

Dear Syaiful. 

  

Thank you for the submission of your manuscript for publication in our journal. Your manuscript 

has been received and assigned the Paper ID: 44394-JSSR-018, please remember to quote your 

paper id in all future correspondence. Your manuscript will undergo review process. As soon as 

possible the review report will be sent to your email.  

Should you need any assistance please feel free to contact us via email or live chat. 

  

Best Regards; 

Aneel Khan 

Managing Editor 

Academic Research Publishing Group 

URL: www.arpgweb.com 

Pakistan Office: Rahim Yar Khan, 64200 Punjab, Pakistan 

Germany Office: 47 Kasselbergweg 63619 Bad Orb, Germany 

 

 

On Sat, Nov 3, 2018 at 4:42 AM Syaiful <pak_bakri@unja.ac.id> wrote: 

Dear Aneel Khan, 

Is there any possibility that our manuscript will be included in November issue 2018?  

 

Best wishes 

Syaiful 

 

From: Editor ARPG <editor@arpgweb.com> 

Date: Sat, Nov 3, 2018 at 12:07 PM 

Subject: Re: Paper ID as 44394-JSSR-018 

To: Syaiful <pak_bakri@unja.ac.id> 

Dear Syaiful. 

Thank you for your email. Please note that after completion of review process and acceptance 

your paper will be published in the latest issue as Nov or Dec. 

Your paper is in review process. The report will be sent within 2 weeks. 

 

Regards, 

Aneel Khan 

Managing Editor 

Academic Research Publishing Group 

URL: www.arpgweb.com 

Pakistan Office: Rahim Yar Khan, 64200 Punjab, Pakistan 

Germany Office: 47 Kasselbergweg 63619 Bad Orb, Germany 
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From: Status ARPG <status@arpgweb.com> 

Date: Tue, Nov 13, 2018 at 9:50 PM 

Subject: Syaiful - Letter of Manuscript Acceptance - Preparing Future Teachers in Indonesia: 

Motives of Student Teachers for Entering into Teacher Education Programs 

To: Syaiful <pak_bakri@unja.ac.id> <amirul.mukminin@unja.ac.id> 

Cc: <amirul.mukminin@unja.ac.id> 

Paper ID: 44394-JSSR-018 

Paper Title: Preparing Future Teachers in Indonesia: Motives of Student Teachers for Entering 

into Teacher Education Programs 

Journal: The Journal of Social Sciences Research (SCOPUS Indexed) 

  

Dear Syaiful 

Thank you for submitting your manuscript for publication in our journal The Journal of Social 

Sciences Research. Please be informed that your manuscript has been accepted for publication 

after double blind peer review process. The reviewers have accepted your paper as it is in the 

current version. 

Please pay online + one hard copy publication fee of USD 400 and send the scanned copy of the 

payment receipt to let us start the publication process. 

You can skip the hard copy. If you don’t want to have the hard copy then please pay only online 

publication fee of USD 300. 

It is requested that please pay publication fee within 3 working days so that your article can be 

accommodated in latest issue of journal. We recommend electronic fund transfer to avoid postal 

delay in receiving the article publication fees at the editorial office. Please remember to quote 

your above given paper ID in all future correspondence. 

  

Click here for Payment Details. Your invoice is attached below.  

  

Note: Please don’t forget to acknowledge the letter. Thank you. 

  

Regards; 

 

Aneel Khan 

Managing Editor 

Academic Research Publishing Group 

URL: www.arpgweb.com 

Pakistan Office: Rahim Yar Khan, 64200 Punjab, Pakistan 

Germany Office: 47 Kasselbergweg 63619 Bad Orb, Germany 
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